
Dear Family (brothers & sisters in Christ), 

THANK YOU for staying in contact with one another.  We give ourselves to be in 
relationship with one another.  Indeed, we are a family where we serve, care for 
and encourage one another.  Please let us know if you have needs.  You can 
contact my cell phone. 

The Creek Sheep continue to serve in the communities around us that were hit 
by the tornado.  Pray that their conversations will reflect Christ and that 
fellowship with believers from other bodies will build the kingdom in addition to 
any who come to Christ in faith and surrender. 

We will provide and online video for a scattered congregational teaching and 
congregational worship in song.  Please keep zooming in your groups or working 
the phones as you one another one another.  Our primary care ministry is really 
structured through out community groups.  God WILL CONTINUE to use our 
whole body, our groups and life-on-life ministry as we all do our part.  As we have 
seen in this pandemic, being the church is so much more than Sunday 
mornings.  AND oh how good it is to be one, to be together and to dwell in unity. 

Continue to remember the gospel.  Jesus is the crucified, risen King.  Continue to 
celebrate the life you have in Christ.  Be a witness to the impact King Jesus has 
made in your life.  Heather's COVID-19 Easter Testimony has spread to many.  
We hope people see the impact the Word of God has made on her life before 
and during her illness. 

1 Corinthians 15:1 Now I make known to you, brethren, the gospel which I 
preached to you, which also you received, in which also you stand, 2 by which 
also you are saved, if you hold fast the word which I preached to you, unless you 
believed in vain. 3 For I delivered to you as of first importance what I also 
received, that Christ died for our sins according to the Scriptures, 4 and that He 
was buried, and that He was raised on the third day according to the Scriptures, 
5 and that He appeared to Cephas, then to the twelve... 

Worshiping the Living God in ALL we say and do, 
Pastor Stan on behalf of the whole body


